

Reference: FOI 23486 GLO 11M

Subject: Diabetes & Podiatry

QUESTION	RESPONSE
<p>1. How much money was spent in total on the management of diabetic wounds (A: clinician hourly rates, B: cost of materials) effecting the sole of the foot between January 2015 and January 2017?</p>	<p>Gloucestershire CCG does not hold this information. Gloucestershire Care Services NHS Trust may be able to provide the information and they can be contacted by going to https://www.glos-care.nhs.uk/about-us/freedom-of-information</p>
<p>2. How much money was spent on offloading orthoses (insoles that reduce high pressure points of the foot) for patients with diabetes between January 2015 and January 2017?</p>	
<p>3. How much money was spent on TTCs (Total Contact Casts) used in the management of foot wounds in diabetic patients between January 2015 and January 2017?</p>	
<p>4. How much money was spent on bespoke footwear (customised shoes) made for patients with diabetes-related foot complications between January 2015 and January 2017?</p>	
<p>5. How many home visits were there related to the care for patients with diabetic neuropathic ulcers in 2015-2017 by:</p>	

a) District nurses; and	
b) Podiatrists?	<p>Gloucestershire CCG does not hold this information. Gloucestershire Care Services NHS Trust may be able to provide the information and they can be contacted by going to https://www.glos-care.nhs.uk/about-us/freedom-of-information</p>
6. What is the total cost of routine podiatry appointments for patients with diabetic neuropathic ulcers?	

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 01 December 2017, and has been authorised for release by Ellen Rule, Director of Transformation & Service Redesign for NHS Gloucestershire CCG.