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Reference: FOI 37520 GLO 11M 
  
Subject: Fremanezumab 
 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. Whether you have signed the relevant documentation to make 
Fremanezumab available for patients who are eligible 

From a commissioning perspective, fremanezumab for preventing migraine is 
available in Gloucestershire for eligible patients according to NICE TA631.  
 
I can confirm that the CCG does not hold this information.  We therefore 
suggest you contact Gloucestershire NHS Foundation Trust as they may be 
able to provide the data required; please follow the link given below: 
 
Gloucestershire NHS Foundation Trust. 

2. Has it been signed off and implemented   Yes 

3. Was access to Fremanezumab signed within the 90 days of NICE 
approval 

Yes 

4. How many patients have blue tech approval in your clinical 
commissioning area 

I can confirm that the CCG does not hold this information.  We therefore 
suggest you contact Gloucestershire NHS Foundation Trust as they may be 
able to provide the data required; please follow the link given below: 
 
Gloucestershire NHS Foundation Trust. 

5. How many specialists are there in your area/do you have a 
headache specialist clinic 

6. Do you know the waiting time to access a specialist who 
prescribes Fremanezumab 

https://www.gloshospitals.nhs.uk/about-us/our-trust/freedom-information/
https://www.gloshospitals.nhs.uk/about-us/our-trust/freedom-information/
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7. Whether the administration of any of the treatments is monitored 
by a headache specialist (yes/no) 

I can confirm that the CCG does not hold this information.  We therefore 
suggest you contact Gloucestershire NHS Foundation Trust as they may be 
able to provide the data required; please follow the link given below: 
 
Gloucestershire NHS Foundation Trust 

8. Has there been applications to access the drug made by patients  Fremanezumab has a “specialist initiation only” local classification. 

 
 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 31 December 2020 and has been authorised for release by Marion Andrews-Evans, 
Executive Nurse and Quality Lead for NHS Gloucestershire CCG.   

https://www.gloshospitals.nhs.uk/about-us/our-trust/freedom-information/

