

Reference: FOI 38286 GLO 11M

Subject: Mental Health Statistics

I can confirm that the CCG does hold some of the information requested; please see responses below:

QUESTION	RESPONSE												
<p>1. Learning Disability Annual Health Checks for Young People 14-25 years.</p> <p>Could you please provide the information in two categories please?</p> <p>a. young people up to 18 b. young people 19-25</p>	<p>We are unable to provide data by quarter and therefore have not completed the spreadsheet. This information is available from NHS Digital website.</p> <p><u>Young People up to 18 - Notes</u></p> <ul style="list-style-type: none"> • Data extracted by PCCAG from the Gloucestershire CCG Trust TPP and EMIS reporting systems on 11/03/2021 (will only include data up to and including 10/03/2021) • Data extracted from 71 out of 72 practices • Please note that the data is based on the patients age as at today, not when they had the Annual Health Check or Health Action Plan Completed or Reviewed <p>% of LD patients aged 0-17 with an Annual Health Check between 01/04/20 - 10/03/21 (Percentage based on Number of patients on the QOF Learning Disabilities Register)</p> <table border="1" data-bbox="551 1010 2123 1137"> <thead> <tr> <th>LD Register 0-17</th> <th>Annual Health Check completed (236 eligible 14-17)</th> <th>% AHC for those that are eligible</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>600</td> <td>121</td> <td>42%</td> </tr> </tbody> </table> <p>% of Patients on the QOF Learning Disabilities Register aged 0-17 with an Annual Health Check recorded between 01/04/20- 10/03/21 and with a LD Health Action plan Completed or Reviewed between 01/04/20- 10/03/21, (Percentage based on Number of patients on the QOF Learning Disabilities Register and an Annual Health Check recorded between 01/04/20- 10/03/21).</p> <table border="1" data-bbox="551 1342 2123 1453"> <thead> <tr> <th>Annual Health Check completed</th> <th>Health Action Plan</th> <th>%</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>121</td> <td>79</td> <td>65%</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	LD Register 0-17	Annual Health Check completed (236 eligible 14-17)	% AHC for those that are eligible	600	121	42%	Annual Health Check completed	Health Action Plan	%	121	79	65%
LD Register 0-17	Annual Health Check completed (236 eligible 14-17)	% AHC for those that are eligible											
600	121	42%											
Annual Health Check completed	Health Action Plan	%											
121	79	65%											

Young people 19-25 - Notes

- Data extracted by PCCAG from the Gloucestershire CCG Trust TPP and EMIS reporting systems on 16/03/2021 (will only include data up to and including 10/03/2021)
- Data extracted from 71 out of 72 practices
- Please note that the data is based on the patients age as at today, not when they had the Annual Health Check or Health Action Plan Completed or Reviewed.

% of LD patients aged 19-25 with an Annual Health Check between 01/04/20 - 10/03/21 (Percentage based on Number of patients on the QOF Learning Disabilities Register)

LD Register	Annual Health Check completed	%
705	439	62.2

% of Patients on the QOF Learning Disabilities Register aged 19-25 with an Annual Health Check recorded between 01/04/20- 10/03/21 and with a LD Health Action plan Completed or Reviewed between 01/04/20- 10/03/21, (Percentage based on Number of patients on the QOF Learning Disabilities Register and an Annual Health Check recorded between 01/04/20- 10/03/21)

Annual Health Check	Health Action Plan	%
439	363	82.6

2. CAMHS Children and Young People

Could you please provide the information in two categories please?

- a. young people up to 18**
- b. young people 19-25**

The CCG does not hold this information. We suggest you contact [Gloucestershire Health and Care NHS Foundation Trust](#) as they may be able to further assist with your query.

<p>3. Assessment for Autism Waiting time</p> <p>Could you please provide the information in two categories please?</p> <p>a. young people up to 18 b. young people 19-25</p>	<p>The CCG does not hold this information. We suggest you contact Gloucestershire Health and Care NHS Foundation Trust as they may be able to further assist with your query.</p>
<p>4. Wheelchair services for children <18 and 18-25?</p> <p>Could you please provide the information in two categories please?</p> <p>a. young people up to 18 b. young people 19-25</p>	<p>The CCG does not hold this information. We suggest you contact Gloucestershire Health and Care NHS Foundation Trust as they may be able to further assist with your query.</p>

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 25 March 2021, and has been authorised for release by Kim Forey, Director of Integration for NHS Gloucestershire CCG.